
 

 

 

Admissions & Records Update 
May 21, 2025 

Payment Due Date & 

Autodrop for Summer 2025 

The payment deadline for students enrolling on or before May 12th for 

Summer 2025 is Monday, May 26th.  The autodrop will be scheduled overnight 

the morning of Tuesday, May 27th.  For more information see the Payment 

Deadlines by Semester page. 

Registration for Fall Underway 

Priority registration for Fall 2025 began April 14th, for Priority 0 and continues 

through open registration began on May 13th. Visit the Priority Registration 

and Enrollment Dates page for a complete listing of the priority registration 

dates. 

Payment Due Date & 

Autodrop for Fall 2025 

The payment deadline for students enrolling on or before July 25th for Fall 

2025 is Friday, August 8th.  The autodrop will be scheduled overnight the 

morning of Saturday, August 9th.  For more information see the Payment 

Deadlines by Semester page. 

Updates to Residency 

Requirements for Associate 

Degrees Effective Fall 2023 

Associate degrees, both local and transfer, require students to complete 

twelve units in residence within the Los Rios Community College District.  

Residency requirements for associate degrees were updated statewide to 

reflect twelve units districtwide over twelve units at a specific college via a title 

5 update that became effective in November 2023.  Los Rios formally adopted 

these changes in regulation in December 2024.  

From this point forward,  Los Rios evaluators will consider residency as twelve 

units districtwide retroactively from Fall 2023 to present.  Evaluators at each 

campus have ensured that these requirements have been retroactively applied 

to any student who had not met the residency requirement for the campus, 

but did meet the expanded residency requirement, from Fall 2023 forward 

have had their graduation petitions reevaluated and degrees awarded where 

applicable. 

Los Rios Partners With 

AACRAO to Improve 

International Student 

Experience 

Los Rios has contracted with the American Association of Collegiate Registrars 

and Admissions Officers (AACRAO) to align practices on international student 

admissions and produce training materials to keep the colleges in alignment 

and improve onboarding of new staff in this area.  Importantly, this work will 

ensure a consistent high quality experience at each of our college International 

Student offices.  AACRAO was on site last week to meet with staff, faculty and 

others who work directly with international students, and engaged a panel of 

international students to describe their experiences to better inform this 

process. 

Common Course Numbering 

Update 

Los Rios is implementing its first phase of the Common Course Numbering 
transition in Fall 2025.  Math and English placements have been updated to 
reflect the new course numbers and students with existing education plans 
will also see the new course numbers in their iSEPs.  Click here to read more 
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about Common Course Numbering within Los Rios and to see the courses 
renumbered in the first phase. 

Cal-GETC Update 

Beginning Fall 2025, the Cal-GETC general education pattern replaces the 
IGETC and CSU Breadth general education patterns for students with catalog 
rights beginning in Fall 2025.  Students with older catalog rights can also opt 
for Cal-GETC or continue with their current GE pattern.  A new local general 
education pattern has also been implemented beginning Fall 2025.  For more 
information click here. 

Transfer Evaluation Service 

The Transfer Evaluation Service (TES) is now being used by Admissions & 
Records to track and process course substitution and equivalency requests for 
credit earned outside of Los Rios. TES provides faculty who review these 
requests a side-by-side comparison of course descriptions and additional 
documentation provided by the student. TES will reduce repetitive reviews by 
faculty and create a repository of approved courses as approved by faculty.  

Announcing Tracy 

Hemmenway, Admissions & 

Records Supervisor at Folsom 

Lake College 

 

We are excited to announce Tracy Hemmenway has been selected as the new 
Admissions & Records Supervisor serving the Los Rios Community College 
District at Folsom Lake College 

 Tracy has been a dedicated member of the Los Rios Community College 
District for over 23 years, serving at the El Dorado Center of Folsom Lake 
College in Admissions & Records and Student Services. She holds a bachelor’s 
degree in Political Science from the University of South Carolina-Upstate and a 
Human Resource Management Certificate from the University of the Pacific. 

 As the Educational Center Assistant at EDC, Tracy led front-line student 
services and support staff. Most recently, she has served as the Student 
Support Specialist for the Prison and Reentry Education Program (PREP), 
where she coordinates comprehensive support services and helps 
justice-impacted and in-facility students navigate admissions, financial aid, 
counseling, and academic records. 

 In her spare time, Tracy enjoys playing softball and pickleball, camping, and 
spending time with her family and two dogs, Boomer and Cash.  Her bucket list 
vacation includes visiting every Major League Baseball park and has 15 parks 
completed so far. 

 Tracy will begin her new role on May 27th. Please join us in welcoming Tracy 
to her new role! 

 

 

For more information: https://employees.losrios.edu/our-organization/departments-and-offices/student-services 
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